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Meet The Author





Mitch Garlington
Born in Frome Somerset, Mitch has been aware
of spirit and the world of magick from a young

age. He is a professional Spiritual Medium,
Psychic, Tarot Reader, Male Witch, Healer,
established Author and Mentor in his own

rights.
Growing up was always an interesting time for
me as I was forever being taking into different
worlds that co-exist within that of our own. I
wanted to create a deck that touched on these

different elements of myth and magick. From as
far back as I can remember I was often being
visited by things that were other worldly or 



experiences would happen that the average
person was unaware of. The Wizard Within

Oracle deck has been a labour of love but I am so
pleased with the end result. 

I do feel like a massive part of who I am is
captured within the deck. The work that spirit

constantly allow me to do really does touch my
heart and I feel so lucky and blessed to be able to

call this my life's work. 
My hope is that my oracle deck will offer an

extension of healing and psychic information to
help people that are maybe at a crossroads in
their life. I also hope that it can encourage and
bring out the natural magick and intuition that

resides within each of us.



For further information about Mitch
Visit:

Instagram - @MitchTarotMedium
Facebook - The Official Mitch Garlington
Email - TarotWitchMitch87@hotmail.com



www.Mitch-Garlington.co.uk



Meet The Artist





Melanie Ciavattone
My story starts in rural Wiltshire, home of stone
circles, mystical crop circles and white horses on
hills. I grew up with a love of art, inspired by my
mother, a talented artist. I’ve drawn and painted

the world around me since childhood. My
journey has taken me to the coast, Brighton and

Bournemouth, working as an occupational
therapist. I’ve always been inspired to keep

creating, whether it was in Brighton’s Lanes,
Boscomb’s pier. No matter where I was, I was

comforted by the connection to spirit who
would always give me hope, reassuring me that

my art life would be my saving grace. 



Life favours the brave, as they say, and just as I
thought I was living my best life it got better. I

met my American husband and crossed the
Atlantic. Living in South Carolina, with my

husband, I am surrounded by incredible wildlife
- pelicans, dolphins and turtles - very different

from my Wiltshire roots. I have a passion for art,
wildlife, magic, spirituality, helping and bringing
joy to others. It was truly written in the stars that
I would work with the beautiful soul Mitch. He

had faith in my art and how we would work
together on this inspired project. Working with

Mitch’s words for each card, I was guided to
create each scene. I even kept a note pad by the

bed as first morning downloads are my absolute
favourite. I now know that my connection to

spirit is through my inspiration to create



For further information on MeltangleArt
Visit:

Instagram - @Meltangle.art
Facebook - Meltangleart

Email - Meltangleart@gmail.com



The Wizard Within 
Card Spreads

Here are some magical card spreads to have a go
at trying out...






The Sun, The Moon & Stars - Three card spread













The Sun - What is being reenergised for you at
this time.



The Moon - What is being cleared and cleansed

for you at this time.



The Stars - What wishes are about to come true.



The Stone Circle Compass - Five card spread

1.

2.

3.

4. 5. 

Card 1 - North - Earth - What grounds you?



Card 2 - East - Air - What are your inner most
thoughts?



Card 3 - South - Fire - What are you passionate
about?



Card 4 - West - Water - What touches your

heart?



Card 5 - Spirit - What defines you?



The Wizards Wands Transformation -
 Five card spread














Card 1 - Represents my transformation



Card 2 - What this looks like day to day



Card 3 - What this could look like in the future



Card 4 - What I need to work through



Card 5 - Missing piece of the puzzle that I am not
aware of






The Wizards Tree - Six Card Spread

1.

2.

3.4. 5.

6.



Card 1 - Seed - Potential 



Card 2 - Roots - Firm foundations



Card 3 - Stalk - Fast growth



Card 4 - Leaves - Where to expand



Card 5 - Flower where to experience gratitude



Card 6 - Fruit - Culmination of the work







These are just a few types of spread to try. It is
also worth pulling a daily card and seeing what

the messages are from the wizard within. 



You also have the magical wizard incantations
which can be used within a spell. Or you can be

used as a daily mantra of affirmation to help you
through your day.



Card 1 - 
The Golden Cloak

- Key Words - 
Protection

Safety - Shielding
Boundaries

You may be feeling very drained of late? this
could be to do with people, circumstances or

situations going on around you. If you have been
drawn to this card it's time to put on the golden

cloak of protection, this will help shield you
from the outside energies of the world. 

Visualise a beautiful golden cloak being placed
around you. Feel the soft fabric and image it has

a lovely big hood, pull the hood up. You feel
cushioned and safe, imagine this shielding you

and sending away any negative energies.  



Visualise the cloak getting brighter and starting
to form a golden aura around you, it's as bright
as the sun. Allow that lovely light to shine out
into the universe and keep all lights shining
bright, particularly when you feel drained

around dark or negative people or situations.
The more you can use this technique, the less
untoward energies will be able to affect you.
Negative influences around you will become

more distant. The cloak can be put on at any time
and you will always be kept protected and safe.





 

 - Wizard Incantation -



I put on my cloak to protect me from harm.
Sending love and light to the world and mother
earth who continues to fight for her beauty at

this time. My cloak feels like a layer of skin, with
golden light, I am safe within.



Card 2 - 
The Wizards Staff

- Key Words - 
Strength
Support
Balance 

Anchoring

Notice how the wizard walks about the land,
holding his staff and allowing it to guide him
safely forward. It keeps him supported and

balanced and on his feet. 
If you have been drawn to this card the wizard's

staff is coming in to give you strength and
support at this time. Whilst you have been

walking about your daily life, you are starting to
feel like the ground below you is not as solid as
you first thought. It feels like you are walking
through mud or quicksand and your feet are



starting to sink. Use your own staff within to
guide you through this boggy road until you get

back onto solid ground. Once you have reach
hard land take comfort and know you have the

needed strength to move forward with ease, and
a renewed sense of energy. Allow that inner

strength to grow and continue to keep you on
your feet at all times.








 - Wizard Incantation -



I use my staff to guide my way, through mud and
dirt I don't delay. Though leaves may scatter at

my feet, I journey on to life's great treat. Though
roads are slippery and unknown I journey on

until I end up home. 



Card 3 - 
The Stone Circle

- Key Words - 
New Beginnings

Power
Personal Aliveness

Stillness - Reflection

The stone circle is calling you... This is a time of
reflection, change and new beginnings, the

ancient ritual stones have been watching you.
They have been standing since the dawn of time

watching and listening and will continue to stand
when everything else starts to crumble.

If you have been drawn to this card you are
waking up to a deeper power and new energy
that resides within you. It's an energy that is so

new to you, yet also feels so old. It's a wise
ancient energy that you are just learning to 



harness and tap into. Full of creativity, power
and personal aliveness. You feel at one with

yourself in mind, body and spirit. As old cycles
come to an end, it's time to welcome a new ritual
and allow the next cycle of your life to blossom
and begin. You can welcome this new change

and allow new doors to open for you. In the past
there have been times when you have been

standing in the way of you. But you feel this new
wave of energy from the earth's core and hear

the distant rumble of thunder in the sky, as you
connect to a higher power - vibration. The

stones will stand and watch over you now, as
they have always done with previous cycles,

until this new lesson is complete.





 - Wizard Incantation -



As I stand within the circle of stones, I welcome
new doors to open whilst old ones close. As old
as time, as hard as rock, the stones my weather
but their power does not. I feel the earth, I see



the moon, the light is brighter as my power
continues to bloom.



Card 4 - 
The Wise Wizard

- Key Words - 
Wisdom

Knowledge
Awareness
Teachings

The wise wizard is an old soul that has lived
many different lifetimes. They have a fountain of

knowledge in both the spiritual, magical and
physical worlds. Knowledge is power and they

will only ever use this for the greater of good or
to enrich someone's life. If you have been drawn

to this card you feel like an old soul on young
shoulders. You too have experienced many lives
before and are retaping into that knowledge and

energy. It is time to share the knowledge you
have learnt and acquired with those around you. 



A Wise wizard knows that the information is not
purely for self. It has always been giving with the

knowing it will be passed down to others to do
good, and this is now what you need to do with

those that look up and respect you. 
Wise wizards know when to speak up for what
they believe in. But they also know and are not

afraid to act, when enough is enough, and to turn
around and walk away. Allow the teachings

within to be passed down to the next generation
of wizards within.






 - Wizard Incantation -



I live in this physical world, whilst carrying the
teachings from the old ways into the new world.
I pass on the knowledge for the greater of good,

in the hope mankind can find peace with his
fellow brothers and sisters, and the universe can

start to heal.



Card 5 - 
The Wizards
 Cauldron

- Key Words - 
Fire - Battleground

 Protection
Take Action

Defend

The wizard will only call upon his cauldron in
times of trouble and need when he must defend
and stand up for what he believes in. If you have
been drawn to this card now is such a time. Like

a cauldron bubbling over with a roaring fire
underneath to keep its potion brewing. You feel

like this with life, everything is bubbling and
brewing over and it's all getting a bit too hot to

handle and fiery. 
Now is the time to take action, and stand up for
what you believe in. Don't allow the cauldrons 



potion to bubble over and become ruined.
Continue to perfect and see this through to the
end. Yes, you may get slightly burnt along the

way, but the end potion is worth the pain.
Wizards know more than anyone else that

sometimes we must walk away and walk alone.
This may or may not be the case here, but know

whatever happens, you can pull the cauldron out
at any time needed, to create a potion to help you

in these hours of need. 





 - Wizard Incantation -



Eye of toad, wing of bat, a drop of this and that.
A potion to calm and sooth the soul, whilst

hotheads melt and lose control. No harm I cause,
no magick wasted, I walk away all hurts

deflected.



Card 6 - 
The Scrying Ball

- Key Words - 
Seek The Truth

 Visions - Intuition
Manifest

The wizard has many tools in his toolbox, but
none more special and powerful than the scrying
ball. If you have been drawn to this card it is time
to use your own scrying ball and see the magic,

you have within.
You may have found you are getting a lot of

strange feelings recently; things may be
happening that you can't quite explain?

Things may be playing out as you visualised or
foresaw them to be. You have indeed been gifted

from a young age, yet you may have been 



ignoring or neglecting your natural pathway.
Unexplainable dreams, premonitions, or 

de-Ja-vu, maybe happening on a regular basis?



There have been to many unanswered stories of
late, it is now time to call upon the true wizard
within and allow this natural power to grow. 
Ancient wizards work with magic, the spirit

world, and call upon mother earth.
You will find you will start to listen to your own
intuition more. Allow and welcome this in. It will

indeed guide you forward and help you on the
next chapter of your journey.



 - Wizard Incantation -



I hold this ball within my hand. I look and study
across the lands. Images racing all around. I see a
story but hear no sound. Winds may blow, and
spirit's whistle. Silent messages given need no

approval. I am blessed to be shown what spirits
give me. I understand this gift is within me.



Card 7 - 
The Talisman

- Key Words - 
Unconditional Love

 Blessed
Emotional Abundance

The wizard was given a talisman from a young
age from his ancestors, it's something you may
not see at first glance. It is usually worn under
robes and clothing, but the wizard treasures it

and keeps it safe and worn near the heart. 
If you have been drawn to this card, you are

treasuring the world you live in at such times.
Family, friends, partners, children & animals, the
unconditional love that is shown to you both in
this physical world and the love from the spirit

realm.



like the wizard, you may have your own
talisman hidden from many to see. Yet it forms a
bond, invisible golden threads that wrap around
your heart, keeping all, you love and hold dear to

you.
The talisman is a very rare gift and one we all

deserve. Allow your own talisman to sparkle and
shine bright and take the love you feel from it

and keep it safe with you always. 
We all deserve to experience unconditional love

and a wizard is no different.





- Wizard Incantation -



I feel my talisman beneath my wears, its warmth
surrounds me, it has no cares. Emotions passed

yet bonds so strong, the love I'm giving will
always live on. For this I treasure every day, love

is for a lifetime not just a day. 



Card 8 - 
The Enchanted Forest 

- Key Words - 
Healing - Nature

Grounding
Solitude

Whilst wizards walk in everyday life, they need
time to regenerate and revitalise. If you have

been drawn to this card there is a need to
recharge and heal. Go to the enchanted forest, a

sacred space for you, a place that offers
tranquillity, where you can escape from the

demands of the physical world. Notice the smells
and the sounds, the magic and beauty the forest

holds within it. You may have been feeling so
rushed off your feet with the hustle and bustle of

life, that you are feeling very dizzy or   



quite ungrounded. Take time out in the
enchanted forest, allow your roots to go deep

down into mother earth. Feel connected,
grounded, anchored and safe. This is a place just
for you, your own enchanted forest that you can

come to as little or as often as you feel is
necessary.

When you need that time to reconnect and
briefly turn the world off.






- Wizard Incantation -



I feel the earth beneath my feet. Its roots pull me
down and hold me deep. I feel connected, I feel

at peace, the world falls silent, I find relief. 
No harm is caused, no voices raised, whilst

nature speaks and sings life's praise.   





Card 9 - 
The Dark Wizard

- Key Words - 
Evil 

Danger - Warning
Deception

Listen - Pay attention

A wizard knows that there is both light and dark
in the world. Both are needed to keep balance

and order. We all have a moral compass and that
creates good and bad, right and wrong. If you
have been drawn to this card, you need to be

aware of the light and dark - good and bad
around you at this time. Most wizards work with
light and truth, but you may have been getting a

heavy or uneasy feeling around a person or
people in recent times - pay attention. Wizards'

robes may swish when pulled around



dark wizards walk they leave no sound. Be
careful with whom you talk to, and how their

energy leaves you feeling. If you are getting a gut
feeling that someone may not be as genuine as

you first thought, it is important to trust the
warning signs. This will save you a lot of
heartache and hurt further down the line.

Remember like a venomous snake, dark wizards
will portray themself in a positive light. Be aware

of the signs so you don't become infected by
their poison. As dark wizards can go unnoticed
as they walk amongst us in our everyday life.

Keep your light bright and trust the signs you are
getting. Remember energy never lies






- Wizard Incantation -



Whilst hoods are pulled up high to shadow one's
face, the power within does not misplace. Gut
feelings pull you in certain ways, it's a time to
listen and obey. No hurt is needed, no action

taken, you know the truth - the truth has spoken.



Card 10 - 
The Quartz Crystal 

Point

- Key Words - 
Healing
Magick

Meditation
Finding Inner Peace

The clear quartz crystal point is very important
to any working wizard. If you have been drawn

to this card now is an important time, to use
your crystal point to recharge and heal yourself.
You may have been feeling slightly off balance
lately, or over doing the magick. You may have
felt your emotions are very extreme high one

minute and low the next. Take some time out for
you, sit and meditate with your quartz crystal

point. Use it with the beauty of the sun light and
watch and see how the light shines through



the crystal shards. It forms a beautiful healing
rainbow. The colours reenergise all your chakra

points. and you feel at peace, balanced and
healed. Anytime you feel drained you can go

somewhere and use your crystal point to
recharge. A wizard's work is never done. So,

make sure you make this a priority in your daily
life, so that you don't become burnt out. Wizards
heal so many others but forget to stop and heal

themselves.  





- Wizard Incantation -



I hold my crystal point; I feel golden sunshine
bright and allow my inner rainbow to be

exposed. The rainbow from within the crystal,
balances, cleanses, and heals my inner body, my
physical body and my aura. I am blessed and at

peace with all things at this time. 



Card 11 -
The Wizards Hat

- Key Words - 
Happy - Positive

Pride 
Celebration

Unique - Powerful



The wizards hat completes a wizard's outfit. But
it's not just a hat, it's so much more, a medal a

sign that shows you have survived and made it
on your magical journey. If you have been

drawn to this card everything is coming to you,
just at the right time. The wizard's hat is

symbolic, it's a success after harder times. This is
very much a victory for you in life. You have

been through some dark adventures but against
all odds, you have come out on top a survivor.
It's time to wear your hat proudly and see how 



good it looks on you. Be proud to hold your head
up high and wear the pointed peak with pride.
Other wizards indeed look up to you and hear

about the tales you have been through. But most
importantly you can smile when you relive your

tales to others. What a journey you have been
on, but you are still here to tell your own story.
Wow just stop for a second and celebrate how
great that feels. Know that you are one of the

most powerful wizards at this moment in time
and embrace that feeling and smile.






- Wizard Incantation -



I put on my hat and wear it with pride, while
others scuff and laugh, I beam from inside.

Through Fiery dragons and darkest realms, my
hat is still on me, safe and sound. A smile, a grin
from ear to ear, you cannot judge me, I'm strong

and I have no fear. 







Card 12 -
The Wizards Wand

- Key Words - 
Intuition - Trust

Power
Change 




Perhaps the most powerful of tools is that of the
wizard's wand. When wizards are first given a
wand, they don't come with any instructions.

They have to trust that they will learn and know
how to use the magick within correctly. If you
have been drawn to this card, this is a time of

higher connection. It's a time to trust in all areas
of your life. If you are struggling with something

you must trust the power within, and like
waving a wand, do what is needed to correct the
situation. Trust is something that comes hard to 



us all but know it is within reach. You have
always been able to use your own wand, yet you
have found in the past, outside influences have

blocked and made it hard to work with. Hold the
wand firmly and allow the incantation you speak

to follow. Trust and let it come naturally. You
will find this is much easier than you first

thought. Anything that needs correction now is
the time to focus on doing just that.








- Wizard Incantation -



A wand I hold within my hand, no words are
written they come to hand. I trust my power

deep within. The wands a tool to guide love in.
With words comes power, with power comes

truth, a leap of faith allows in good.



Card 13 -
The Wizards Owl

- Key Words - 
Watcher

Messenger
Truth seeker

Waiting 



Wizards have a love for all forms of life but none
more sacred, than gatekeepers of magick the

trusted owl. Owl flies high above the land and
becomes the wizard's eyes and ears in the sky.

Bringing back information and passing on
messages and news for the wizard at high

speeds. If you have been drawn to this card, you
are indeed waiting for much awaited news.

There is a need to know quickly so send your
own owl forward, to allow the information to

come back to you as quickly as possible. 



whatever the news is weather good or bad, know
you will have received the information in a

timely manner. The owl will give you the
strength and support needed to tackle situations
at this time. Owls roam above in the skies, and

you may go days, months or years without
seeing them. Or calling upon them, but know
they are always there watching from above.

Waiting to be called in as and when there magick
is needed.








- Wizard Incantation -



I call upon my feathered friend, news awaits my
life depends. High in the sky I call your name,
my guardian gate keeper sores in to guide my

way. Above he watches, above his listens, silent
messages past on in sequence. Awaited news he

passes on, he flies away his work is done.  



Card 14 -
The Spell Book

- Key Words - 
Transformation
Manifestation

Growth
Inner Power




The wizard has a range of tools he works with,
but none older than his trusted spell book.

Incantations that have been recorded and past
down from ancestors before. The book holds all
sorts of secrets, power and magick. If you have
been drawn to this card it's a powerful time of
transformation. There has been a lot of talking

with you of late about, hopes, dreams, goals and
desires. You have big plans and ideas of what
you would like your future to be, but are not

sure how to make these things happen or 



turn them into reality. You can see the goal but
are unsure of the steps to take to get there. Use
the spell book within and manifest any changes
needed to turn hopes and dreams into reality.

Write down and speak out loud what you need
to happen to make this possible. The only person

standing in your way of this is you. The spell
book will offer the incantations needed to allow

this magical change from within to occur.







- Wizard Incantation -



My spell book open but the pages are empty, the
words that are needed are not a plenty. I look

within and ask myself what holds me back? what
stops my heart? I know the answers, I know the

words, the spell I cast to set free my curse. I have
the power deep within the magick awaits it's

time to begin.  



Card 15 -
The Crystal Cave

- Key Words - 
Grounding

Safety
Hidden - Solitude

Comfortable



The crystal cave is known to very few people
apart from the wizard. It's a place that offers
comfort and safety. Nobody but the wizard

knows where this place is, and he feels free here,
and almost like time stops and comes to a

standstill.
If you have been drawn to this card like the

wizard, you have been spending a great deal of
time in your own version of the crystal cave. 

This maybe indeed your home or another place
that is sacred and special to you.



you to feel free here and accepted without any
conditions. You feel safe and secure, and can be

yourself, which is much needed at this time.
Candles lit around the cave, the light flickers and
shines almost like a temple of beauty that is for

your eyes only. 
Use this time to enjoy your own company and
reflect on how far you have come on your own
pathway or journey. The entrance to the cave
has a big stone that you can wave your hand
over, to move as gentle as a feather. A secret

place you can come and go to as little or as often
as is required.








- Wizard Incantation -



A wave of my hand, the stone door opens, a
secret place, my inner space. Whilst it may seem
small and damp to some. It is my palace, a place

unknown, where magick happens and fairies
twinkle. I'm safe inside my own earthly crystal. 



Card 16 -
The Wizards Unicorn

- Key Words - 
Purity

Creativity
Strength

Unconditional Love





Deep within the enchanted forest there is a
secret creature known only to a few magical folk.  
Only the most creative of people who naturally

believe will see, the wizard's unicorn. A
beautiful, mystical, magical creature. The

unicorn's horn, gold and silver hold's such a rare
power and creative energy.

If you have been drawn to this card now is a
time to let creativity flow. But like the unicorns
horn which is rare, ideas that flow come from

yourself make sure you embrace and take



full credit for your own artistic flare. The
unicorn gracefully, walks through the forest and
lights up a darkened road. This is what you must

now do with your own creative energy. Don't
allow others around you to hold you back, like
the unicorn not everyone can see this beautiful

creature straight away.









- Wizard Incantation -



I walk along a leaf swept road. I stop, I listen, I
hear no sound. Then there before me a silhouette
I see, golden, silver blinds me. I freeze then and

there, solid no words I can speak. I feel the
magick, deep beneath my feet. I study in the

distance, the shimmer and glare of the unicorn's
spirit standing there.    



Card 17 -
The Potion Bottle

- Key Words - 
Self-Confidence

Devaluing
Believe
Illusion






Like with all great wizards at times they lose
their way and lose sight of what they truly hold
inside. If you have been drawn to this card, you

have recently lost your bottle, lost your
confidence, and are playing yourself down or

devaluing yourself. 
It is time to take out and drink the contents

within the wizard's potion bottle. A mystical
formula created many moons ago in the event it

was needed for such times. As you drink the
potion feel its power surge down through you. 



from the top of your head to the base of your
feet. Visualise a stunning purple light working its

way down through your body. This powerful
energy recharges you, and you feel alive,

confident, ready to take on the world once more. 
The potion is complete, you once again have the

power in all areas of your life as you did once
before. It's time to stand tall and proud and
believe in the magick you hold within you.










- Wizard Incantation -



This potion I drink to reconnect my power. I lost
my way, feeling darker by the hour. I feel the

magick go through my soul. Its power is strong it
takes over full control. It realigns my body,

connects me deep with the earth, the power is
speaking time to see my true worth.



Card 18 -
The Warlock

- Key Words - 
Misunderstood

Empowered
Identity - Remember

Who you are 





The warlock is a wizard of great power. He feels
comfortable in his own skin and feels connected,

above with the spiritual world and grounded
below with mother earth. If you have been

drawn to this card, like the warlock you know
what your about. You know your truth and

identity. It may have taken you a while to get to
this stage in your life journey, but the important
thing is you are here now. You know how you
work and how you want to conduct yourself

within the world around you. 



in the past you may have had to really defend
yourself, your beliefs, and your own magical

ways of the world. 
However, now you are standing your ground

and flying solo but flying free. The warlock
represents a time for celebration you have
accepted yourself on all levels and can now

embrace the full magick this world has to offer
you. 










- Wizard Incantation -



Voices from the past echo around. The judging
that once took place stops without making a

sound and is nowhere to be found. The warlock I
am today stands tall and proud. I know my place

I have found my way.



Card 19 -
The Drinking Horn

- Key Words - 
Vitality

Hydration
Cleansing






Deep within the enchanted forest lies a mystical
waterfall. This is where wizards gather with their
drinking horns to drink the healing waters. The
water heals, cleanses, and detoxes the body. If

you have been drawn to this card it's time to stop
and take care of yourself. Get out your own

drinking horn and start to drink from it. You
have found of late; you are not always drinking
regularly and are sipping on the go. You may be
going for long periods of time without any fluid.

This is not good and can make you feel dizzy, 



tired, or drained and dehydrated. A wise wizard
always carries some water deep within the vessel
of the drinking horn, to keep himself hydrated at

all times.
Like a plant that needs to be watered, you are

being encouraged to put the same level of self-
love and care into you. Don't allow your energy

to become too thirsty. Stay hydrated.









- Wizard Incantation -



I place my drinking horn into the water and
watch as it fills up with healing waters ready to
drink. Such power, I cleanse my body and my

soul, my thirst complete. Hydrated my mind and
body stay in control.



Card 20 -
The Sage & The

Witch

- Key Words - 
Soulmates

Unity
Friendship






Long ago there was a time when the sage met his
soulmate, black raven hair with piercing eyes,
red velvet cloak, the sage met his witch.  If you
have been drawn to this card, now is a time to

stop and take action. There is somebody around
you that you have a heart centred connection

with. This maybe just as good friends or it may
be growing and developing into something

deeper. 
You may not have known each other for very

long, yet it feels like you have known each



other for an eternity. You may feel like you are
soul mates, destined to be together and in each

other's lives for the greater of good. 
Stop trying to understand how or why, and just
allow this beautiful connection to happen. It is

something so sacred, special and rare, not many
people get to experience it in its complete state,

only a rare few are chosen. 
You are blessed to be one of these. Take control
and know this is a person that will not wish to

hurt or take from you. They care too deeply
about you they just want to bring in eternal love

and share this world with you.





- Wizard Incantation -



From a far, I see their face, through smoke and
time I can't misplace. They look familiar, yet we
have just met. Their energy feels old yet familiar
I cannot forget. Two hearts bound as one from

times before, reconnect in this life for
adventures and more. 



Card 21 -
The Black Dragon

- Key Words - 
Conflict

Battle
Restrictions

Communication - Honour





High in the sky within the mountains the darkest
of all creatures' roams. The fiery blaze cannot be

mistaken, the black dragon, a frightful beast,
such power and venom, he wants to defeat.

If you have been drawn to this card there is a lot
of conflict going on with or around you at this
this time. You are not looking for any, yet you

may find situations or circumstances are pulling
you in. Things may be feeling a little fiery or

becoming too hot to handle. 
It's time to put the fire out and untie the ropes



that are pulling you in. Whilst you don't always
like to use your voice now is the time to scream
and be heard. Use your wand on the dragon to
spellbind it with an incantation that comes to

hand. 
Know and trust you hold the power needed

within you, communication is needed in order to
overcome the dark forces in hand and defeat the

black dragon. Time to speak up for what you
believe in. 








- Wizard Incantation -



Whilst fire may be blown my way, no hurt it
causes no burns today. I use my wand as a

shield. Protect my heart, I have freewill. Whilst
words may blow back and forth, the time is now
to end this dual. I send all hurts and drama away,

I will solider on to fight today. 



Card 22 -
The Wizards Tree

- Key Words - 
Patience
Mature
Strong

Graceful





Deep within the crystal cave, something so
special no one else has seen. The wizard's tree, so
tall and beautiful, yet also old and tired. Its roots

stretch for miles around the crystal kingdom.
 If you have been drawn to this card, there are

many changes coming in for you. But most
importantly you must wait patiently for things to

grow into fruition. You may have been very
eager to get moving forward with new ideas and
wanting things to happen before they are fully
grown or matured. Like the wizard he had to 



plant the seeds and watch the tree take root and
slowly grow and mature over many years.

Whilst this may seem a bit long winded to you,
be sure that good things come to those that wait
and trust that your patience will be rewarded. 

Like the wizard's beautiful tree, it grew from his
patience, that has been for his eyes only to see.
Allow your own roots to start slowly growing

ready for when the time comes to blossom.









- Wizard Incantation -



I throw the seeds into the earth. I look, I wait, I
just see dirt. Whilst time goes on, I slowly see, a

bud that blossoms there before me. I wait a day, I
wait a week, two more leaves have blossomed as

I speak. I get the point it's trying to make -
Somethings in life are worth the wait.






Card 23 -
The Wizards Athame

- Key Words - 
Change
Ritual

Detach
Empower






Beneath the wizards' robes, tight around his belt,
lies his trusted athame. Whilst he rarely needs to
use this tool, he still has it on him always just in
case. If you have been drawn to this card, there
is a real need to make some changes or detach

from something. You have been finding old
patterns have been repeating themselves. You
may have felt a change is needed but feel a bit
scared or unsure how to detach from the old

cycle to embrace the new. The wizard wants you
to review your life and look at what you 



treasure and hold dear to you. He also wants you
to look at what else is going on. What's really
needed or important in the grand scheme of

things. Or are you holding on to old energy that
could be restricting or blocking the pathway

forward? If you feel something's are becoming
heavy, it's time to use the athame and cut the

cords that are holding you back. See how easy
the blade slices through and detaches the

bindings that once restricted you. Changes are
sometimes painful but necessary. Take comfort

in the knowing the cords have now been cut.
New energy can find its way in and deeper

magick can now begin.





- Wizard Incantation -



A change I feel is needed. One step forward I
start to bleed. The rope that restricts and burns

my skin, it's time to cut and allow change in. I cut
the cords from every angle. I feel set free its time

to sparkle.



Card 24 -
Land Of The Fairies

- Key Words - 
Laughter

Fun
Joy

Mischief - Playful





Whilst the wizard walks the woods, he hears a
load of voices. They chime and chatter he can't

make it out but a gentle smile crosses his face. He
has reached the land of the fairies. He knows he
must keep his guard up, as fairies love to laugh,

joke and cause mischief. If you have been drawn
to this card now is the time to stop being so

serious and have a good laugh. Like the fairies,
you are also known at times to have a good sense
of humour, dry, quick and witty. It's time to stop
and smile with the world again and have a good 



belly laugh, perhaps it's been a while since you
allowed yourself to. Don't feel you are letting

people down from the spirit world by having fun
and living your life. Spirit wants you to be

happy, have fun and laugh freely with them.
Things may have been pretty serious in recent

times, yet you are a fun-loving person. The
fairies are reminding you not to let the laughter
stop. Enjoy and embrace for laughter is the best
form of medicine, we have to heal the heart. So,

we can live and love all within the world. 







- Wizard Incantation -



People think I'm serious when in fact I'm not. I'm
smiling from within, it's just my face that's not. I

know what makes me happy, I know what makes
me smile, the world we live in can be such a

funny place. The inner laughter I can now let
show across my face.



Card 25 -
The Dark Coin

- Key Words - 
Finances

Loss
Savings

Hardship





The dark coin is something all wizards will carry
with them at some point in their life. This comes
into their life as a teaching or higher experience.

It may at times make you feel stuck or limited
forever, but you in fact have the power to

change this from dark to gold. If you have been
drawn to this card the coin centres around
finances. Because it's a dark coin this card

suggests that you may be lacking in material
abundance or prosperity in recent times. But

take comfort in the knowing that this is merely 



a phase and something that may be coming in as
a slight test in recent times. Whilst it might feel

like there is no hope, or a clear way forward, you
have struggled before and found your way back
on top, so this current set back is no different. 

It is now time to use your magick within to turn
the coin from dark to gold. Once you give
yourself permission to receive wealth and
abundance, watch the gold coins pure in. 

 





- Wizard Incantation -



I hold this coin within my hand. So dark, so
worn, so grubby. I throw it into a wishing well,
my hopes, my dreams made weary. Relieved it's

gone from my grasp; I carry on steady. I stop and
smile for on the ground a golden coin lays

merry.



Card 26 -
The Golden Coin

- Key Words - 
Finances

Abundance
Prosperity - Hardwork

Wealth - Success





The golden coin is something all wizards work
towards achieving. This can take months or even

years. The way of the wizard has been truly
accepted on all levels, and whilst you use your

gifts every day, you have made a deal with
mother earth that they are used for the greater of

good. If you have been drawn to this card the
world is smiling with you. The golden coin

centres around finances and the way you choose
to live your life. You have finally reached a place
where you have abundance in an emotional and



financial way and things feel safe and
comfortable. This has been an emotional battle,

but despite all the dark coins you came into
contact with, you have not given up on your

inner magick. You continued to move forward
and did the necessary work required. This card
is celebrating that success for you at this time.
You are a hardworking wizard and have been

from a young age. It's time to stand tall and
proud, and smile and see how far you have come

and celebrate the successes of life. 







- Wizard Incantation -



I catch a glimpse there in the distance something
pure and sparkling. I hold my hand out to see a
golden coin in front of me. So bright, so bold, it
lights up the night. The light shines bright and

heavenly. I am blessed to know that I have used
this beautiful gift for all to see.   



Card 27 -
The Enchanted Lake

- Key Words - 
Self-Love

Inner Acceptance
Mindfulness

Peace
Nostalgia - Reflection








The water's edge calls you in as you make your
way to the enchanted lake. Like a big mirror, you

stand on the bridge above and gaze into its
mystical waters. 

If you have been drawn to this card, there has
been a lot of over studying with you in recent

times and overlooking or reviewing of the past.
You have never really felt fully comfortable with
what you see before you. You look into the water

and see your face change being taken back to
times of old. Wizards must learn to be at peace 



with the face they see reflecting back at them and
love the person that you have become. The story

may not have always been perfect, but it has
shaped you into the person you are today. Whilst
you may find it difficult to hold love for yourself

do not sacrifice the essence of you. You know
what you have had to go through to stand tall in

today's world, and no one can take this away
from you. It's time to accept who you are. Be
happy with the scars you may wear, or the

ageing of your skin, for your inner beauty and
light continues to shine from within.








- Wizard Incantation -



I look into the deep waters and see a face before
me. It looks so worn and battered; I turn my eyes
away. I look back and notice, the eyes sparkling
before me, whilst faces may weather, the light
burns bright, the inner beauty is still igniting. 



Card 28 -
The Wizards Castle

- Key Words - 
Home

Security
Sacred Space

Change - Moving









The wizard walks back to his cave a place that is
just for him. Whilst he feels contented here, he

stops and looks out over through the mountains
into the distance and notices a castle. 

If you have been drawn to this card it's time to
access your home or inner kingdom. Whilst your

home may look visually lovely, you are feeling
disconnected from it and know it's time for a

change. You are starting to feel detached from
the place you are currently calling home. You
may even be resenting or not wanting to go



home after a long day. Regularly cleansing your
home with incense or white sage, can take away

any negative feelings in the short term. However,
if you have been doing this and are still feeling

unsettled, then a new home awaits you. Like the
castle in the distance there is a need to find

somewhere new that you can move to and call
home. This maybe somewhere nearby or

perhaps its time to look further afield. Either
way act now and put the steps in place to make

this happen. A new adventure is ready to be had,
it's time to pack up your wizardry possessions

and venture forward.







- Wizard Incantation -



As I venture home, I stop and look out ahead of
me. Rolling mist and smoke surround a beautiful
castle out at sea. Its mystical windows lit up with
candlelight, somewhere new is calling me. A new
home I will attract, sacred space I will have back.



Card 29 -
The Enchanted

Teardrop

- Key Words -
Tears

Depression
Grief

Soul Seeking









There have been many tears of recent times,
some may be physical others may be internal. As
all wizards know they don't always like to show

there tears freely, they prefer to keep them
hidden and locked away from the world to see.
If you have been drawn to this card there have

been some tears that need release. It's really
important to honour these tears and not feel
guilty or bad for feeling the way that you do.

This is merely part of a healing process all
wizards must go through at some stage of there



life. Whilst the feelings at the time feel like they
will go on forever, take comfort in the knowing

that they will stop, and the feelings will pass.
Allow yourself time to realise any tears that have

been bottled up away from the world to see.
Notice how lighter you feel from offloading

these energies. Allow the tears to be caught by
mother earth who will transmute the energy,

into something more wholesome and positive.
She will send any old energies into the earth to

be cleared, cleansed and reset.









- Wizard Incantation -



A lonely tear runs down my face. I feel it trickle
and leave its trace. More tears come and follow
on, the time is needed the hurts are gone. Once

eyes felt tired and slightly sore, feel uplifted and
love enters and conquers all.  



Card 30 -
The Magick
Gathering

- Key Words -
Friendship

Mischief
Memories

Adventures









Whilst wizards tend to walk alone on occasion,
they have a mystical gathering usually in the

changes of the seasons. This is a most magical
time for wizards as they are able to reconnect to
others they haven't seen for a while. If you have

been drawn to this card it's time to reconnect
with friends or maybe family, you haven't seen
for a while.  What is great about these types of
connection, is it doesn't matter how long-time

passes, you just pick up from where you left off.
These are some of the most important people  



within your life, and that love always radiates
even if they're not always physical present. 
Friendships that last forever no matter how

many days, weeks, months or years go by. Like
the wizard there is a special gathering coming up

for you at this time. Beautiful souls are
reconnecting and putting the worlds to right.
Treasure this time however little or often it

happens. As true friendship is a rare gift of its
own. 








- Wizard Incantation -



I walk into the crowd I start to smile and laugh.
Voices from the past call my name, as if no time

has passed. We laugh and talk and reminisce
about all the good and bad. Forever friends,

there always there, for such a joy it is they care.  



Card 31 -
The Sun, The Moon 

& Stars

- Key Words -
Forgiveness - Letting Go

Wishes
Hopes

Dreams - Healing









The wizard is a very gentle soul who works with
the sun for renewed energy, the moon for

strength, and the stars for hope. The wizard has
been reflecting over past hurts that he is

struggling to let go off or put to bed. If you have
been drawn to this card like the wizard you're

holding onto some past hurts. You haven't been
able to understand why you were treated or

spoken to the way you were. You can't quite get
your head around what's happened and are
struggling to make sense of it all. Whilst this



may seem a tough time, there is a need for
forgiveness here. Not for the person who has

upset you, but for the actions they have taken. 
Forgiveness is needed from you so you can free
yourself of this unneeded baggage. Why should

you be made to feel this way? Whatever has
happened it cannot be changed, however how
we choose to respond, and act can be changed. 
Therefore, Forgiveness is so important as it will

heal yourself and the person who caused the
hurt. It might be that you have to walk away or
disconnect them from your life. Either way is

perfectly fine and what needs to be actioned. Use
the suns energy to heal you of this pain. Use the

moon to cleanse your soul and send a wish to the
stars for hope and forgiveness.






- Wizard Incantation -



I watch the sun go down, so big, red and clear
the day is nearly done the mystic moon appears.

I share all my worries, hurts and upsets, she 



watches and she smile's while I let go of all
regrets. I see a shooting star dazzle through the

sky, new hopes, new dreams, new wishes all
catch my eye. The sun reawakens from its

earthly sleep. 
A new day has been granted a new adventure yet

to complete.



Mitch & Melanie would like to take this
opportunity to thank you for purchasing and
supporting a small independent business and

being part of the journey of 



The Wizard Within Oracle deck.



You may have seen Mitch's cheeky dog Oscar
featured in some of the cards... 

Oscar is Mitch's witches familiar and when there
is magick to be created Oscar is never far away. 

Thank you...
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